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#%08>213>50% ANOTHER%CHRIST;%ANOTHER%GOSPEL%

%%%%%%(RSV)%
%
%
% :30%%Ezekiel%3:17;%Philippians%3:2;%Matthew%24:4,11%%
Warnings%of%false%teachers.%%%
%
% 2:05%%Jeremiah%23:16>17,%21>22%%The%Lord%reveals%the%
false%prophets%and%their%message.%%Visions%of%their%own%minds%
and%not%the%word%of%the%Lord.%
%
% 3:15%%Matthew%7:15%%Those%who%come%in%sheep’s%clothing,%
yet%they%are%wolves.%%Their%intent%is%to%spoil%the%kingdom%of%
God,%by%destroying%the%clearness%of%the%testimony%>%confusing%
the%saints.%
%
% 3:50%%Acts%20:29>30%%Paul%warns%the%Ephesian%elders%of%
the%false%teachers.%
%
% 4:40%%2%Peter%2:1%%Peter%reflects%on%the%past%false%teachers%
and%warns%of%those%to%come.%
%
% 5:20%%1%John%4:1%%Already%in%the%first%generation%of%
Christians,%the%false%teaching%had%begun.%
%
% 8:50%%Ezekiel%3:17>19%%“Son%of%man,%I%have%made%you%a%
watchman%for%the%house%of%Israel;%whenever%you%hear%a%word%
from%my%mouth,%you%shall%give%them%warning%from%me.%%18%If%I%
say%to%the%wicked,%‘You%shall%surely%die,’%and%you%give%him%no%
warning,%nor%speak%to%warn%the%wicked%from%his%wicked%way,%in%%
%



#%%08>213>50%%%Cont’d%
%
order%to%save%his%life,%that%wicked%man%shall%die%in%his%iniquity;%
but%his%blood%I%will%require%at%your%hand.%%19%But%if%you%warn%
the%wicked,%and%he%does%not%turn%from%his%wickedness,%or%from%
his%wicked%way,%he%shall%die%in%his%iniquity;%but%you%will%have%
saved%your%life.%
%
% 10:00%Teaching%on%those%who%sought%to%undermine%Paul.%%
First%Group%>%the%unbelieving%Jews.%%Teaching.%%Reference%Acts%
13:50%Antioch.%%Acts%14:2%%Iconium,%%Acts%14:19,%%Lystra%%Acts%
17:5%%Thessalonica,%%Acts%18:12>13%Corinth.%
% Second%Group%–%Jewish%converts%who%accepted%the%
Messiah%but%also%wanted%to%keep%the%requirements%of%the%law,%
(i.e.)%Circumcision.%%Teaching.%
%
% 13:30%%Acts%15:1%%The%teaching%that%circumcision%was%
required%caused%a%controversy.%%Peter%declares%that%salvation%
comes%by%faith%in%Jesus%alone.%Reference%Acts%15:6>11.%%It%is%not%
Jesus%+%something%else.%%The%saving%grace%of%Jesus%is%a%gift%and%
not%a%wage%for%good%works%–%Reference%Romans%4:4.%
%
% 16:35%%Exodus%20:3>4%%Teaching%on%Aaron’s%approval%of%
making%a%golden%calf.%%
%
% 18:40%%Galatians%1:6>9%%I%am%astonished%that%you%are%so%
quickly%deserting%him%who%called%you%in%the%grace%of%Christ%and%
turning%to%a%different%gospel%—%%7%not%that%there%is%another%
gospel,%but%there%are%some%who%trouble%you%and%want%to%
pervert%the%gospel%of%Christ.%%8%But%even%if%we,%or%an%angel%from%
heaven,%should%preach%to%you%a%gospel%contrary%to%that%which%
we%preached%to%you,%let%him%be%accursed.%%9%As%we%have%said%
before,%so%now%I%say%again,%If%any%one%is%preaching%to%you%a%
gospel%contrary%to%that%which%you%received,%let%him%be%
accursed.%%%%
%



#%%08>213>50%%%Cont’d%
%
% 21:00%%Teaching%on%Mormonism.%%A%non>Christian%
movement.%
%
% 33:35%%2%Corinthians%4:2>5%%Paul%declares%that%he%will%only%
preach%the%true%Gospel%–%Jesus%is%Lord.%
%
%



Ezek. 3:17 “Son of man, I have made you a watchman for the house of Israel; whenever whewhenever you hear a word from my mouth, you shall give them warning from me. meme. 

Ezek. 3:17 “Son of man, I have made you a watchman for the house of Israel; 
whenever you hear a word from my mouth, you shall give them warning from 
me. Phil. 3:2   Look out for the dogs, look out for the evil-workers, look out for those thosethose who mutilate the flesh. 

Phil. 3:2   Look out for the dogs, look out for the evil-workers, look out for 
those who mutilate the flesh. Matt. 24:4 And Jesus answered them, “Take heed that no one leads you astray. 

Matt. 24:4 And Jesus answered them, “Take heed that no one leads you astray. Matt. 24:11 And many false prophets will arise and lead many astray. 

Matt. 24:11 And many false prophets will arise and lead many astray. Jer. 23:16   Thus says the LORD of hosts: “Do not listen to the words of the prophets prophprophets who prophesy to you, filling you with vain hopes; they speak visions of ofof their own minds, not from the mouth of the LORD.  17 They say continually to toto those who despise the word of the LORD, ‘It shall be well with you’; and to every eveevery one who stubbornly follows his own heart, they say, ‘No evil shall come upon upupon you.’” 

Jer. 23:16   Thus says the LORD of hosts: “Do not listen to the words of the 
prophets who prophesy to you, filling you with vain hopes; they speak visions 
of their own minds, not from the mouth of the LORD.  17 They say continually 
to those who despise the word of the LORD, ‘It shall be well with you’; and to 
every one who stubbornly follows his own heart, they say, ‘No evil shall come 
upon you.’” Jer. 23:21   “I did not send the prophets, yet they ran; I did not speak to them, yet yetyet they prophesied.  22 But if they had stood in my council, then they would have havhave proclaimed my words to my people, and they would have turned them from fromfrom their evil way, and from the evil of their doings. 

Jer. 23:21   “I did not send the prophets, yet they ran; I did not speak to them, 
yet they prophesied.  22 But if they had stood in my council, then they would 
have proclaimed my words to my people, and they would have turned them 
from their evil way, and from the evil of their doings. Matt. 7:15   “Beware of false prophets, who come to you in sheep’s clothing but inwardly ininwardly are ravenous wolves. 

Matt. 7:15   “Beware of false prophets, who come to you in sheep’s clothing but 
inwardly are ravenous wolves. Acts 20:29 I know that after my departure fierce wolves will come in among you, you, you, not sparing the flock;  30 and from among your own selves will arise men speaking spspeaking perverse things, to draw away the disciples after them. 

Acts 20:29 I know that after my departure fierce wolves will come in among 
you, not sparing the flock;  30 and from among your own selves will arise men 
speaking perverse things, to draw away the disciples after them. 2Pet. 2:1   But false prophets also arose among the people, just as there will be false fafalse teachers among you, who will secretly bring in destructive heresies, even denying dedenying the Master who bought them, bringing upon themselves swift destruction. destructiodestruction. 

2Pet. 2:1   But false prophets also arose among the people, just as there will be 
false teachers among you, who will secretly bring in destructive heresies, even 
denying the Master who bought them, bringing upon themselves swift 
destruction. 1John 4:1   Beloved, do not believe every spirit, but test the spirits to see whether whetherwhether they are of God; for many false prophets have gone out into the world. 

1John 4:1   Beloved, do not believe every spirit, but test the spirits to see 
whether they are of God; for many false prophets have gone out into the world. 



Ezek. 3:17 “Son of man, I have made you a watchman for the house of Israel; whenever whewhenever you hear a word from my mouth, you shall give them warning from me. meme.  18 If I say to the wicked, ‘You shall surely die,’ and you give him no warning, warningwarning, nor speak to warn the wicked from his wicked way, in order to save his his his life, that wicked man shall die in his iniquity; but his blood I will require at your yoyour hand.  19 But if you warn the wicked, and he does not turn from his wickedness, wickedwickedness, or from his wicked way, he shall die in his iniquity; but you will have havehave saved your life. 

Ezek. 3:17 “Son of man, I have made you a watchman for the house of Israel; 
whenever you hear a word from my mouth, you shall give them warning from 
me.  18 If I say to the wicked, ‘You shall surely die,’ and you give him no 
warning, nor speak to warn the wicked from his wicked way, in order to save 
his life, that wicked man shall die in his iniquity; but his blood I will require at 
your hand.  19 But if you warn the wicked, and he does not turn from his 
wickedness, or from his wicked way, he shall die in his iniquity; but you will 
have saved your life. Acts 13:50 But the Jews incited the devout women of high standing and the leading leadinleading men of the city, and stirred up persecution against Paul and Barnabas, and anand drove them out of their district. 

Acts 13:50 But the Jews incited the devout women of high standing and the 
leading men of the city, and stirred up persecution against Paul and Barnabas, 
and drove them out of their district. Acts 14:2 But the unbelieving Jews stirred up the Gentiles and poisoned their minds minminds against the brethren. 

Acts 14:2 But the unbelieving Jews stirred up the Gentiles and poisoned their 
minds against the brethren. Acts 14:19   But Jews came there from Antioch and Iconium; and having persuaded persuadepersuaded the people, they stoned Paul and dragged him out of the city, supposing suppossupposing that he was dead. 

Acts 14:19   But Jews came there from Antioch and Iconium; and having 
persuaded the people, they stoned Paul and dragged him out of the city, 
supposing that he was dead. Acts 17:5 But the Jews were jealous, and taking some wicked fellows of the rabble, rabblerabble, they gathered a crowd, set the city in an uproar, and attacked the house house house of Jason, seeking to bring them out to the people. 

Acts 17:5 But the Jews were jealous, and taking some wicked fellows of the 
rabble, they gathered a crowd, set the city in an uproar, and attacked the 
house of Jason, seeking to bring them out to the people. Acts 18:12   But when Gallio was proconsul of Achaia, the Jews made a united attack attaattack upon Paul and brought him before the tribunal,  13 saying, “This man is persuading ppersuading men to worship God contrary to the law.” 

Acts 18:12   But when Gallio was proconsul of Achaia, the Jews made a united 
attack upon Paul and brought him before the tribunal,  13 saying, “This man is 
persuading men to worship God contrary to the law.” Acts 15:1   But some men came down from Judea and were teaching the brethren, brethrenbrethren, “Unless you are circumcised according to the custom of Moses, you cannot cancannot be saved.” 

Acts 15:1   But some men came down from Judea and were teaching the 
brethren, “Unless you are circumcised according to the custom of Moses, you 
cannot be saved.” Acts 15:6   The apostles and the elders were gathered together to consider this matter. mmatter.  7 And after there had been much debate, Peter rose and said to them, “Brethren, “B“Brethren, you know that in the early days God made choice among you, that by by by my mouth the Gentiles should hear the word of the gospel and believe.  8 And AndAnd God who knows the heart bore witness to them, giving them the Holy Spirit Spirit Spirit just as he did to us;  9 and he made no distinction between us and them, but bbut cleansed their hearts by faith.  10 Now therefore why do you make trial of God GoGod by putting a yoke upon the neck of the disciples which neither our fathers nor nnor we have been able to bear?  11 But we believe that we shall be saved through throughthrough the grace of the Lord Jesus, just as they will.” 

Acts 15:6   The apostles and the elders were gathered together to consider this 
matter.  7 And after there had been much debate, Peter rose and said to them, 
“Brethren, you know that in the early days God made choice among you, that 
by my mouth the Gentiles should hear the word of the gospel and believe.  8 
And God who knows the heart bore witness to them, giving them the Holy 
Spirit just as he did to us;  9 and he made no distinction between us and them, 



but cleansed their hearts by faith.  10 Now therefore why do you make trial of 
God by putting a yoke upon the neck of the disciples which neither our fathers 
nor we have been able to bear?  11 But we believe that we shall be saved 
through the grace of the Lord Jesus, just as they will.” Rom. 4:4 Now to one who works, his wages are not reckoned as a gift but as his due. ddue. 

Rom. 4:4 Now to one who works, his wages are not reckoned as a gift but as his 
due. Ex. 20:3   “You shall have no other gods before me. 

Ex. 20:3   “You shall have no other gods before me. Ex. 20:4   “You shall not make for yourself a graven image, or any likeness of anything anyanything that is in heaven above, or that is in the earth beneath, or that is in the the the water under the earth; 

Ex. 20:4   “You shall not make for yourself a graven image, or any likeness of 
anything that is in heaven above, or that is in the earth beneath, or that is in 
the water under the earth; Gal. 1:6   I am astonished that you are so quickly deserting him who called you in inin the grace of Christ and turning to a different gospel —  7 not that there is another anoanother gospel, but there are some who trouble you and want to pervert the gospel gosgospel of Christ.  8 But even if we, or an angel from heaven, should preach to you yoyou a gospel contrary to that which we preached to you, let him be accursed.  9 As AAs we have said before, so now I say again, If any one is preaching to you a gospel gospgospel contrary to that which you received, let him be accursed. 

Gal. 1:6   I am astonished that you are so quickly deserting him who called you 
in the grace of Christ and turning to a different gospel —  7 not that there is 
another gospel, but there are some who trouble you and want to pervert the 
gospel of Christ.  8 But even if we, or an angel from heaven, should preach to 
you a gospel contrary to that which we preached to you, let him be accursed.  9 
As we have said before, so now I say again, If any one is preaching to you a 
gospel contrary to that which you received, let him be accursed. 2Cor. 4:2 We have renounced disgraceful, underhanded ways; we refuse to practice practipractice cunning or to tamper with God’s word, but by the open statement of the thethe truth we would commend ourselves to every man’s conscience in the sight of ofof God.  3 And even if our gospel is veiled, it is veiled only to those who are perishing. perisperishing.  4 In their case the god of this world has blinded the minds of the unbelievers, unbunbelievers, to keep them from seeing the light of the gospel of the glory of Christ, ChrChrist, who is the likeness of God.  5 For what we preach is not ourselves, but Jesus JesJesus Christ as Lord, with ourselves as your servants for Jesus’ sake.   

2Cor. 4:2 We have renounced disgraceful, underhanded ways; we refuse to 
practice cunning or to tamper with God’s word, but by the open statement of 
the truth we would commend ourselves to every man’s conscience in the sight 
of God.  3 And even if our gospel is veiled, it is veiled only to those who are 
perishing.  4 In their case the god of this world has blinded the minds of the 
unbelievers, to keep them from seeing the light of the gospel of the glory of 
Christ, who is the likeness of God.  5 For what we preach is not ourselves, but 
Jesus Christ as Lord, with ourselves as your servants for Jesus’ sake.  


