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%
WILL%GOD%INDEED%DWELL%WITH%MAN%ON%EARTH%

%
%
% 00:%>%%Explanation%of%how%the%series%“Great%Questions%of%
the%Bible”%came%to%be.%%Terry%has%determined%that%there%are%
3294%Questions%which%appear%in%the%Bible.%%2272%Questions%in%
the%Old%Testament%and%1022%in%the%New%Testament.%%
%
% 9:40%%2%Chronicles%6:18%%“Will%God%indeed%dwell%with%man%
on%earth”?%%The%bible%is%not,%as%supposed%by%many,%the%story%of%
man’s%quest%for%God.%%It%is%rather,%the%story%of%how%God%
progressively%reveals%himself%as%making%it%possible%for%man%to%
reestablish%his%relationship%with%him.%
%
% 14:00%%Exodus%29:43>46%%God%establishes%his%presence%
among%his%people,%so%that%they%will%know%that%he%is%their%Lord.%
%
% 17:10%%Exodus%%40:34>35%%God’s%glory%completely%filled%the%
Tabernacle.%
%
% 18:10%%1%Chronicles%17:1,%11>14%%David%wishes%to%build%the%
Lord%a%more%suitable%dwelling%(rather%than%the%tent).%%God%tells%
David%that%it%is%not%he%who%will%build%the%temple%but%one%of%his%
sons.%%God%says%of%the%Son%that%he%will%be%his%father%and%his%
kingdom%will%last%forever.%
%
%
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%
% 22:35%%Jeremiah%23:5>6%%A%Predictive%prophecy%
(approximately%400%years%after%David%had%died,%and%600%years%
before%Jesus%was%born),%which%said%that%one%of%David’s%
descendants%who%will%be%a%righteous%“Branch”%called%“The%Lord%
of%Our%Righteousness”.%
%
% 24:20%Zechariah%6:12>13%%The%one%whose%name%is%the%
“Branch”%will%be%both%a%King%and%a%Priest,%in%perfect%harmony.%
%
% 27:00%%2%Chronicles%7:1>2%%The%glory%of%the%Lord%filled%the%
Temple%(this%time%it%is%not%the%tent%but%the%real%temple%of%
Solomon).%%
%

27:40%%Matthew%1:20>23%%Whereas%God%had%previously%
been%unapproachable%in%his%dwelling%place,%now,%we%are%told%
that%He%will%come%among%us%in%the%flesh.%

%
29:10%%John%2:19>21%%Jesus%now%discloses%that%He%will%be%

the%temple%(the%dwelling%place%of%God).%
%
30:30%%Ephesians%2:19>22%%God’s%people%(the%body%of%

Christ%–%the%church)%will%be%the%dwelling%place%of%God%–%His%
Temple%>%held%together%by%the%cornerstone.%

%
33:30%%1%Corinthians%3:16>17%%We%are%the%Temple%of%God,%

by%virtue%of%the%Holy%Spirit%dwelling%in%us.%
%
34:25%%1%Corinthians%6:19>20%%There%is%to%be%a%glory%about%

us,%beyond%our%frail%human%body.%
%
%
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%
35:50%%1%Peter%2:4>5,%9>10%%You%are%a%brick%in%the%full%

Temple%of%God%and%you%are%part%of%the%Royal%Priesthood%of%all%
believers.%

%
37:20%%Revelation%21:3%%Now%the%dwelling%place%of%God%is%

with%men,%and%He%will%live%with%them.%%They%will%be%his%people,%
and%God%himself%will%be%with%them%and%be%their%God.%

%
39:20%%First%God%above%us,%then%God%with%us%(Immanuel),%

and%now%God%within%us%(The%Holy%Spirit).%We%are%the%Temple.%
%
%



2Chr. 6:18   “But will God dwell indeed with man on the earth? Behold, heaven and andand the highest heaven cannot contain thee; how much less this house which I have hhave built! 

2Chr. 6:18   “But will God dwell indeed with man on the earth? Behold, heaven 
and the highest heaven cannot contain thee; how much less this house which I 
have built! Ex. 29:43 There I will meet with the people of Israel, and it shall be sanctified by my mmy glory;  44 I will consecrate the tent of meeting and the altar; Aaron also and his hhis sons I will consecrate, to serve me as priests.  45 And I will dwell among the people ppeople of Israel, and will be their God.  46 And they shall know that I am the LORD LORLORD their God, who brought them forth out of the land of Egypt that I might dwell dwdwell among them; I am the LORD their God. 

Ex. 29:43 There I will meet with the people of Israel, and it shall be sanctified by 
my glory;  44 I will consecrate the tent of meeting and the altar; Aaron also and 
his sons I will consecrate, to serve me as priests.  45 And I will dwell among the 
people of Israel, and will be their God.  46 And they shall know that I am the 
LORD their God, who brought them forth out of the land of Egypt that I might 
dwell among them; I am the LORD their God. Ex. 40:34   Then the cloud covered the tent of meeting, and the glory of the LORD LORDLORD filled the tabernacle.  35 And Moses was not able to enter the tent of meeting, meetmeeting, because the cloud abode upon it, and the glory of the LORD filled the tabernacle. ttabernacle. 

Ex. 40:34   Then the cloud covered the tent of meeting, and the glory of the 
LORD filled the tabernacle.  35 And Moses was not able to enter the tent of 
meeting, because the cloud abode upon it, and the glory of the LORD filled the 
tabernacle. 1Chr. 17:1   Now when David dwelt in his house, David said to Nathan the prophet, propheprophet, “Behold, I dwell in a house of cedar, but the ark of the covenant of the LORD LLORD is under a tent.” 

1Chr. 17:1   Now when David dwelt in his house, David said to Nathan the 
prophet, “Behold, I dwell in a house of cedar, but the ark of the covenant of the 
LORD is under a tent.” 1Chr. 17:11 When your days are fulfilled to go to be with your fathers, I will raise raise raise up your offspring after you, one of your own sons, and I will establish his kingdom. kkingdom.  12 He shall build a house for me, and I will establish his throne for ever. eveever.  13 I will be his father, and he shall be my son; I will not take my steadfast steadfast steadfast love from him, as I took it from him who was before you,  14 but I will will will confirm him in my house and in my kingdom for ever and his throne shall be bebe established for ever.’” 

1Chr. 17:11 When your days are fulfilled to go to be with your fathers, I will 
raise up your offspring after you, one of your own sons, and I will establish his 
kingdom.  12 He shall build a house for me, and I will establish his throne for 
ever.  13 I will be his father, and he shall be my son; I will not take my 
steadfast love from him, as I took it from him who was before you,  14 but I 
will confirm him in my house and in my kingdom for ever and his throne shall 
be established for ever.’” Jer. 23:5   “Behold, the days are coming, says the LORD, when I will raise up for David DDavid a righteous Branch, and he shall reign as king and deal wisely, and shall execute exexecute justice and righteousness in the land.  6 In his days Judah will be saved, saved, saved, and Israel will dwell securely. And this is the name by which he will be called: calcalled: ‘The LORD is our righteousness.’ 

Jer. 23:5   “Behold, the days are coming, says the LORD, when I will raise up for 
David a righteous Branch, and he shall reign as king and deal wisely, and shall 
execute justice and righteousness in the land.  6 In his days Judah will be 
saved, and Israel will dwell securely. And this is the name by which he will be 
called: ‘The LORD is our righteousness.’ Zech. 6:12 and say to him, ‘Thus says the LORD of hosts, “Behold, the man whose whosewhose name is the Branch: for he shall grow up in his place, and he shall build the ththe temple of the LORD.  13 It is he who shall build the temple of the LORD, and and and shall bear royal honor, and shall sit and rule upon his throne. And there shall shashall be a priest by his throne, and peaceful understanding shall be between them themthem both.”’ 

Zech. 6:12 and say to him, ‘Thus says the LORD of hosts, “Behold, the man 
whose name is the Branch: for he shall grow up in his place, and he shall build 
the temple of the LORD.  13 It is he who shall build the temple of the LORD, 
and shall bear royal honor, and shall sit and rule upon his throne. And there 



shall be a priest by his throne, and peaceful understanding shall be between 
them both.”’ 2Chr. 7:1   When Solomon had ended his prayer, fire came down from heaven and andand consumed the burnt offering and the sacrifices, and the glory of the LORD filled fifilled the temple.  2 And the priests could not enter the house of the LORD, because becabecause the glory of the LORD filled the LORD’s house. 

2Chr. 7:1   When Solomon had ended his prayer, fire came down from heaven 
and consumed the burnt offering and the sacrifices, and the glory of the LORD 
filled the temple.  2 And the priests could not enter the house of the LORD, 
because the glory of the LORD filled the LORD’s house. Matt. 1:20 But as he considered this, behold, an angel of the Lord appeared to him himhim in a dream, saying, “Joseph, son of David, do not fear to take Mary your wife, wifewife, for that which is conceived in her is of the Holy Spirit;  21 she will bear a son, soson, and you shall call his name Jesus, for he will save his people from their sins.” sinssins.”  22 All this took place to fulfil what the Lord had spoken by the prophet:  23223 “Behold, a virgin shall conceive and bear a son, and his name shall be called Emmanuel” EEmmanuel” (which means, God with us). 

Matt. 1:20 But as he considered this, behold, an angel of the Lord appeared to 
him in a dream, saying, “Joseph, son of David, do not fear to take Mary your 
wife, for that which is conceived in her is of the Holy Spirit;  21 she will bear a 
son, and you shall call his name Jesus, for he will save his people from their 
sins.”  22 All this took place to fulfil what the Lord had spoken by the prophet:  
23 “Behold, a virgin shall conceive and bear a son, and his name shall be called 
Emmanuel” (which means, God with us). John 2:19 Jesus answered them, “Destroy this temple, and in three days I will raise raisraise it up.”  20 The Jews then said, “It has taken forty-six years to build this temple, temtemple, and will you raise it up in three days?”  21 But he spoke of the temple of of of his body. 

John 2:19 Jesus answered them, “Destroy this temple, and in three days I will 
raise it up.”  20 The Jews then said, “It has taken forty-six years to build this 
temple, and will you raise it up in three days?”  21 But he spoke of the temple 
of his body. Eph. 2:19 So then you are no longer strangers and sojourners, but you are fellow fellow fellow citizens with the saints and members of the household of God,  20 built upon uupon the foundation of the apostles and prophets, Christ Jesus himself being the thethe cornerstone,  21 in whom the whole structure is joined together and grows into ininto a holy temple in the Lord;  22 in whom you also are built into it for a dwelling dwellindwelling place of God in the Spirit. 

Eph. 2:19 So then you are no longer strangers and sojourners, but you are 
fellow citizens with the saints and members of the household of God,  20 built 
upon the foundation of the apostles and prophets, Christ Jesus himself being 
the cornerstone,  21 in whom the whole structure is joined together and grows 
into a holy temple in the Lord;  22 in whom you also are built into it for a 
dwelling place of God in the Spirit. 1Cor. 3:16   Do you not know that you are God’s temple and that God’s Spirit dwells dwedwells in you?  17 If any one destroys God’s temple, God will destroy him. For God’s GoGod’s temple is holy, and that temple you are. 

1Cor. 3:16   Do you not know that you are God’s temple and that God’s Spirit 
dwells in you?  17 If any one destroys God’s temple, God will destroy him. For 
God’s temple is holy, and that temple you are. 1Cor. 6:19 Do you not know that your body is a temple of the Holy Spirit within you, yyou, which you have from God? You are not your own;  20 you were bought with with with a price. So glorify God in your body. 

1Cor. 6:19 Do you not know that your body is a temple of the Holy Spirit within 
you, which you have from God? You are not your own;  20 you were bought 
with a price. So glorify God in your body. 1Pet. 2:4   Come to him, to that living stone, rejected by men but in God’s sight chosen cchosen and precious;  5 and like living stones be yourselves built into a spiritual spiritual spiritual house, to be a holy priesthood, to offer spiritual sacrifices acceptable to toto God through Jesus Christ. 

1Pet. 2:4   Come to him, to that living stone, rejected by men but in God’s sight 
chosen and precious;  5 and like living stones be yourselves built into a 



spiritual house, to be a holy priesthood, to offer spiritual sacrifices acceptable 
to God through Jesus Christ. 1Pet. 2:9   But you are a chosen race, a royal priesthood, a holy nation, God’s own ownown people, that you may declare the wonderful deeds of him who called you out ouout of darkness into his marvelous light.  10 Once you were no people but now you yyou are God’s people; once you had not received mercy but now you have received receivreceived mercy. 

1Pet. 2:9   But you are a chosen race, a royal priesthood, a holy nation, God’s 
own people, that you may declare the wonderful deeds of him who called you 
out of darkness into his marvelous light.  10 Once you were no people but now 
you are God’s people; once you had not received mercy but now you have 
received mercy. Rev. 21:3 and I heard a loud voice from the throne saying, “Behold, the dwelling of oof God is with men. He will dwell with them, and they shall be his people, and God GoGod himself will be with them;   

Rev. 21:3 and I heard a loud voice from the throne saying, “Behold, the dwelling 
of God is with men. He will dwell with them, and they shall be his people, and 
God himself will be with them;  


